

Des Moines Public Schools

REF#	Description	QTY	*Adorama Inc	Distinctive Sound	Kansas City Audio	Sweetwater	#Triad Productions	Vintage King	^WASHINGTON MUSIC
	<b>Delivery Days After Receipt of Order</b>		<b>10 Days</b>	<b>14 Days</b>	<b>30 Days</b>	<b>2 Days</b>	<b>30 Days</b>	<b>30 Days</b>	<b>45 Days</b>
A1	PreSonus 32-ch Digital Rack Mixer, SL32SC	1	PRESNUS STUDIO LIVE SBCMP 32CH 26BUS DC, MFG#Studiolive 32SC \$1,900.00	\$2,284.56	\$2,435.72	\$2,859.95	\$2,561.00	\$1,848.00	\$1,879.00
A2	PreSonus 16x8 AVB Stage Box, NSB168	1	PRESONUS 16X8 AVB NETWORKED STAGE BOX, MFG#NSB16.8 \$700.00	\$823.27	\$878.33	\$999.95	\$1,047.00	\$666.40	\$679.00
B2	Electro-Voice 12" ELX200 Powered Speaker, ELX200-12P	2	ELECTROVOICE 12"2WAY PWRD SPKR,US CORD, MFG#F.01U.326.040 \$790.00	\$1,054.18	\$1,132.46	\$1,048.00	\$1,196.00	\$1,020.00	\$918.00
B2	Electro-Voice 18" 1200W ELX Powered Sub, ELX200-18SP	1	ELECTRO-VOICE 18"POWRD SUBWFER,US CORD, MFG#F.01U.326.050 \$562.50	\$713.51	\$798.67	\$1,478.00	\$843.00	\$682.00	\$649.00
B3	On-Stage Stands Spkr Std, Alum (pr) w/Bag, SpkStdBagBun	1	FLASHPOINT C STAND WITH ARM & KNUCKL, SKU#FPLSCSLK \$311.25	\$86.34	\$114.29	\$232.99	\$121.00	\$93.89	\$114.00
C1	Shure BLX Wls HH BETA58 Sys, H10, BLXRHHB58-H10	2	SHURE BLX288/PG58-H10 DUAL VOCAL SYSTM, MFG#BLX288/PG58-H10 \$911.00	\$758.86	\$981.54	\$561.00	\$934.00	\$714.56	\$708.00
C2	Shure BLX Wls Bodypack TXM, H10,BLX1-H10	2	\$196.00	\$599.12	\$370.66	\$174.00	\$315.00	\$245.20	\$248.00
C3	Acacia Headworn Mic, TA4F, Tan, LizPltRdT4Tan	2	No Bid	\$259.98	No Bid	\$349.99	\$712.00	\$504.00	\$210.00
C4	Atlas Sound Rnd Base Low Profile Mic Std, Eb, MS12CE	1	ATLAS SOUND LOW-PROFILE MIC STAND EB NY, MFG#MS-12CE \$48.20	\$41.72	\$45.32	\$63.99	\$72.00	\$46.80	\$54.00
D1	Gator G-Tour SL16 Case, no DH, GTOURSL16NDH	1	GATOR G-TOUR C.FLGHT CS FPRESONUS SL16, MFG#G-TOURPRESL16NDH \$226.00	\$287.92	\$277.88	\$527.99	\$384.00	\$248.77	\$497.00
D2	Gator 4U Shallow G-Pro Rack Case, GPro4U13	1	\$123.00	\$134.24	\$138.93	\$279.99	\$200.00	\$134.00	\$136.00
D3	Gator 2U Drawer for Wireless, DRWWRLSS	1	\$127.15	\$148.49	\$147.36	\$279.99	\$196.00	\$138.03	\$134.00

Des Moines Public Schools

REF#	Description	QTY	*Adorama Inc	Distinctive Sound	Kansas City Audio	Sweetwater	#Triad Productions	Vintage King	^WASHINGTON MUSIC
	Delivery Days After Receipt of Order		10 Days	14 Days	30 Days	2 Days	30 Days	30 Days	45 Days
E1	Pro Co 150' Ethercon to Ethercon Cable, Ethercon150	1	No Bid	\$145.16	No Bid	\$197.49	\$334.00	\$105.00	\$123.00
E2	Pro Co 20' XLRf-XLRm Excellines Mic Cable, XLR20	3	BESCR XLR-20 4-PIN MAL -4-PIN FMAL, MFG#XLR20MF \$74.70	\$79.80	No Bid	\$26.99	\$66.00	\$45.00	\$41.85
E3	Pro Co 5' XLRf-XLRm Excellines Mic Cable, XLR5	1	BESCR XLR-5 4-PIN MAL -4-PIN FMAL, MFG:XLR5MF \$17.35	\$18.83	No Bid	\$22.99	\$19.00	\$12.00	\$12.95
<b>TOTAL</b>			<b>\$5,987.15</b>	<b>\$7,435.98</b>	<b>\$7,321.16</b>	<b>\$6,991.71</b>	<b>\$9,000.00</b>	<b>\$6,503.65</b>	<b>\$6,403.80</b>

NOTE \*Adorama - Item B3 consist of the following: Flashpoint C Stand with Arm & Knuckle, MFG# FP-SC and Slinger Bigbag C-Stand Rolling Bag, MFG#BBL  
 #Triad - Item D2 is G-PRO-4U-19  
 ^Washington - Item A1 is SL3SCIII  
 ^Washington - #Item C3 is Galaxy HSM30BG4sho  
 ^Washington - Item D1 is Gtour 16U Cast